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Cook, Scott

From: CPP Help
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 8:14 AM
To: Cook, Scott
Subject: FW: Hellegaard Mailer
Attachments: processed-a0fed0a1-be86-4727-a2a0-fed5cb61353a_4iSySYAy.jpeg

 

From: Lyn Hellegaard <lhellegaard@msn.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 8:03 AM 
To: CPP Help <cpphelp@mt.gov> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fw: Hellegaard Mailer 
 

Good morning,  
 
Deb suggested I contact you, as she is out of the office.  
 
Good morning Deb, 
  
I just realized a mailer I just sent out didn't have the "paid for by" large enough for someone to read it easily. 
There is a photo of my sign, which has it on there, but it's really small. 
What do I do? 
Thanks,  
Lyn 
 
The disclaimer reads: Paid for by Hellegaard for HD97, 3828 Bellecrest Dr., Missoula, MT 59801. I Ordered 
4,000 these on 9/26/22 they were mailed on 10/13/2022.  

From: Lyn Hellegaard <lhellegaard@msn.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 7:56 AM 
To: Lyn Hellegaard <lhellegaard@msn.com> 
Subject: Photo  
  
 
 
Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 
Get Outlook for Android [aka.ms] 




